
Spank Vibrocore Bars vs Carbon Bars: Choosing 

the Right Handlebars for Your Ride 
 

Introduction: 

Riding a bike is more than just a mode of transportation; it's an 
exhilarating experience that brings us closer to nature and keeps us fit. 
Whether you're an avid mountain biker or a casual rider, finding the perfect 
balance between comfort and performance is essential. One component 
that significantly affects your riding experience is the handlebars. With 
various materials and designs available, it's worth exploring two popular 
options: Spank Vibrocore bars and carbon bars. In this article, we'll delve 
into the characteristics of both types, helping you make an informed 
decision that suits your needs. 



 

Spank Vibrocore Bars: Dampening Vibrations for a Smoother Ride 

Spank Vibrocore bars have gained considerable popularity among riders for 
their unique construction and ability to reduce vibrations. The secret lies in 
Vibrocore technology, where a foam-like material is injected into the 



handlebars' core. This foam helps to absorb and dissipate high-frequency 
vibrations, resulting in a smoother and more comfortable ride. 

One of the significant benefits of Spank Vibrocore bars is their excellent 
vibration damping capabilities. When riding on rough terrain or tackling 
challenging trails, vibrations can fatigue your hands and arms, leading to 
discomfort and a loss of control. The Vibrocore technology significantly 
reduces these vibrations, allowing you to ride longer without experiencing 
excessive fatigue. 

Additionally, the vibration damping properties of Spank Vibrocore bars 
enhance control and stability. By reducing the impact of vibrations on your 
hands, you can maintain a firm grip on the handlebars, especially during 
intense maneuvers or sudden changes in terrain. This increased control 
translates to improved confidence and overall riding performance. 

Spank offers a range of Vibrocore bar models and variations to cater to 
different rider preferences. They come in various widths and rises, allowing 
you to customize the fit to suit your body and riding style. Moreover, Spank 
Vibrocore bars are compatible with different types of bikes, whether you 
prefer a mountain bike, gravel bike, or even a commuter bike. 

Carbon Bars: Lightweight and Responsive 

Carbon bars, on the other hand, have gained popularity due to their 
lightweight nature and responsiveness. Carbon fiber is a material renowned 
for its exceptional strength-to-weight ratio, making it a favorite among 
riders looking to shed weight from their bikes without compromising 
performance. 

One of the key advantages of carbon bars is their lightweight construction. 
The reduced weight contributes to improved acceleration and climbing, 
allowing you to conquer hills with less effort. Furthermore, the stiffness of 
carbon bars enhances power transfer from your body to the bike, 
maximizing efficiency and responsiveness. 

Another benefit of carbon bars is their customizable flex characteristics. 
Manufacturers can fine-tune the carbon layup to provide a specific level of 
flexibility. This flexibility can improve comfort by absorbing some of the 



vibrations and impacts from the road or trail. However, it's important to 
note that the amount of flex can vary between different carbon bars, so it's 
essential to find the right balance that suits your preferences. 

When considering carbon bars, it's crucial to factor in durability and impact 
resistance. Carbon fiber can be susceptible to damage from impacts, and 
improper handling or crashes can potentially compromise their integrity. 
However, with proper care and maintenance, carbon bars can last for many 
years, providing you with a lightweight and responsive riding experience. 

Comparing Spank Vibrocore Bars and Carbon Bars: Finding the Right Fit 

When choosing between Spank Vibrocore bars and carbon bars, several 
factors come into play. First and foremost is the performance and ride 
quality. Spank Vibrocore bars excel in vibration damping, ensuring a 
smooth and comfortable ride. Carbon bars, on the other hand, prioritize 
lightweight and responsive characteristics, providing excellent power 
transfer and acceleration. 

Weight and stiffness 

are also important considerations. Carbon bars have the advantage of 
being lighter, which can be beneficial for climbing and overall bike weight 
reduction. Spank Vibrocore bars, while slightly heavier, offer increased 
durability and impact resistance. Depending on your riding style and 
preferences, you'll need to find the right balance between weight and 
strength. 

Personal preferences and riding style should also influence your decision. 
Factors such as your weight, strength, the type of terrain you ride on, and 
your preferred riding discipline can all play a role. Additionally, budget 
considerations may come into play, as carbon bars tend to be more 
expensive than Spank Vibrocore bars. 

Choosing the Right Handlebars: It's All About You 

When it comes to selecting the right handlebars, it's crucial to identify your 
priorities and needs. Consider the type of riding you do most often, the 
terrain you encounter, and the level of comfort and performance you 



desire. Seek advice from experienced riders or visit your local bike shop to 
get personalized recommendations based on your unique requirements. 

If possible, test different handlebars to see how they feel on your bike. A 
hands-on experience will give you a better understanding of how each type 
performs and whether it aligns with your expectations. Ultimately, you may 
even find that a hybrid approach, combining the benefits of both Spank 
Vibrocore bars and carbon bars, suits your riding style the best. 



 

Conclusion: 

When it comes to Spank Vibrocore bars vs. carbon bars, there is no 
definitive answer as to which is better. It all boils down to your personal 
preferences, riding style, and the type of experience you're seeking. Spank 
Vibrocore bars excel in vibration damping and control, while carbon bars 



offer lightweight and responsive performance. Consider your priorities, 
seek expert advice, and don't be afraid to test different options to find the 
handlebars that will enhance your riding experience to the fullest. 

FAQs: 

1. Are Spank Vibrocore bars suitable for all types of bikes? 

- Spank Vibrocore bars are compatible with various types of bikes, 
including mountain bikes, gravel bikes, and commuter bikes. They offer a 
range of widths and rises to cater to different preferences. 

2. Do carbon bars break easily? 

- Carbon bars can be susceptible to damage from impacts, but with proper 
care and maintenance, they can provide excellent durability. Avoid 
excessive torque and inspect them regularly for any signs of damage. 

3. Can I install carbon bars on an entry-level bike? 

- Yes, you can install carbon bars on an entry-level bike, but it's important 
to ensure compatibility with your bike's stem and other components. 
Consult with a bike professional for advice specific to your bike model. 

4. How do I know if the handlebars are the right width for me? 

- Handlebar width is a matter of personal preference and body dimensions. 
Generally, your handlebars should be slightly wider than your shoulder 
width for optimal control and comfort. 

5. Can I mix and match different handlebar components? 

- It's possible to mix and match different handlebar components, but it's 
essential to ensure compatibility and consult with an expert. Consider 
factors such as stem diameter, clamp diameter, and intended use to make 
informed decisions. 

1. "Spank Industries - Vibrocore Technology":This link directs you to the 
official website of Spank Industries, where you can learn more about 
their Vibrocore technology, its benefits, and the range of handlebars 
they offer. 

2. "The Pros and Cons of Carbon Fiber Handlebars": This article from 
Bicycling.com provides an in-depth analysis of carbon fiber 
handlebars, discussing their advantages and potential drawbacks. It 

https://spank-ind.com/
https://www.bicycling.com/bikes-gear/g20029412/the-10-things-you-didnt-know-about-carbon-fiber/


offers valuable insights for riders considering carbon bars as an 
option. 
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